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FOR IMMEDIATE RELEASE 

________________________________________________________________ 
 

RHB CELEBRATES HARI RAYA AIDIL ADHA WITH CHILDREN A T 
SELAYANG HOSPITAL  

 
 
Kuala Lumpur, 23 September 2015 – On the eve of Hari Raya Aidil Adha, RHB Banking 
Group Managing Director, Dato’ Khairussaleh Ramli together with the management of the 
Group, visited children at the paediatric wards of Selayang Hospital to celebrate the 
festival. 
 
During the visit, patients from all three paediatric wards received duit raya and raya gift 
bags that consist of healthy food and beverage in addition to healthy lunch packs.  
 
The Selayang Hospital’s paediatric wards comprise a total of 160 beds. The hospital 
began offering paediatric rheumatology services in 2003 and has since been the only 
paediatric rheumatology tertiary referral unit in Malaysia. Founded by Dr Tang Swee Ping, 
Consultant Paediatrician and Paediatric Rheumatologist, the paediatric rheumatology unit 
offers specialised procedures for chronic conditions and life threatening cases for children 
with arthritis. 
 
In addition, the unit also offers training to doctors and allied health professionals of the 
same field. It conducts research in paediatric rheumatology and the production of scientific 
papers.  
 
With Dr Tang as the founding member and the current chairman of the Arthritis Foundation 
Malaysia (AFM) Junior Club, many paediatric patients from Selayang Hospital have 
benefited from its activities including day trips to Colmar Tropicale, Bukit Tinggi which were 
intended to introduce therapeutic horse riding. All activities organised by the AFM Junior 
Club are aimed at educating the children on their diseases and to empower them. Dr Tang 
established the AFM Junior Club to provide a patient support group for children and young 
people with arthritis.  
 
Present at the visit were YBhg. Dr Muhammad Yusof Sibert, Deputy Director (Perubatan) 
II, Hospital Selayang; Dr Wan Jazilah Wan Ismail, Head of Paediatric Department and Dr 
Tang Swee Ping, Children’s Specialist Consultant & Head of Rheumatology Department. 
 

Issued on behalf of RHB Bank Berhad by the Group Corporate Communications Division. For 

more information, please call Alicia Pinto at 03-9280 5091/ 012 3496364 or email 

at alicia.christine.pinto@rhbgroup.com.  
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The RHB Banking Group is the fourth largest fully integrated financial services group in Malaysia. 

The Group’s core businesses are streamlined into three main business pillars, namely Group Retail 

and Commercial Banking, Group International Business and Group Corporate and Investment 

Banking.  These  businesses  are  offered through  its  main  subsidiaries  -RHB  Bank  Berhad,  RHB  

Investment  Bank  Berhad, RHB Insurance Berhad and RHB Islamic Bank Berhad, while its asset 

management and unit trust businesses are undertaken by RHB Asset Management Sdn. Bhd. and 

RHB Islamic International Asset Management Berhad. The Group’s regional presence now spans 

ten countries including Malaysia, Singapore, Indonesia, Thailand, Brunei, Cambodia, Hong Kong, 

Vietnam, Lao PDR and Myanmar. It is RHB Banking Group’s aspiration to continue to deliver 

superior customer experience and shareholder value; and to be recognised as a Leading 

Multinational Financial Services Group. 


